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Award-winning author Patricia C. Wrede tells the final chapter of the Star Wars saga, in this 
incredible novel based on one of the most eagerly awaited movies of all time.

The circle will now be complete: the final installment of the Star Wars saga, showing the 
emergence of Darth Vader, the downfall of the Jedi, and the revenge of the Sith.
The graphic novel of Star Wars: Episode III, Revenge of the Sith is a solid representation of 
the highly anticipated conclusion to the most popular film epic in history. Picking up the 
action from Episode II, Attack of the Clones as well as the animated Clone Wars 
microseries, Jedi Master Obi-Wan Kenobi and his apprentice, Anakin Skywalker, pursue 
General Grievous into space after the droid kidnapped Supreme Chancellor Palpatine. It's 
just the latest maneuver in the ongoing Clone Wars between the Republic and the 
Separatist forces led by former Jedi turned Sith Lord Count Dooku. On another front, 
Master Yoda leads the Republic's clone troops against a droid attack on the Wookiee 
homeworld of Kashyyyk. And like the movie, the action takes a quantum leap up when the 
Sith Lord in hiding unleashes his long-simmering plot to take over the Republic, and an 
integral part of that plan is to turn Anakin away from the Jedi and toward the Dark Side of 
the Force. Unless you've been living under a rock the last 10 years, you know that Anakin 
will transform into the dreaded Darth Vader and face an ultimate showdown with his 
mentor, but that doesn't matter. In fact, a great part of the fun is knowing where things will 
wind up but finding out how they'll get there. The end of this prequel trilogy also should 
inspire fans to want to see the original movies again, but this time not out of frustration at 
the new ones. Rather, it's the fond memories Episode III will trigger as it ties up threads to 
the originals in tidy little ways. But best of all, it seems like for the first time we actually care 
about what happens and who it happens to.
 The 96-page comic adaptation by Miles Lane and Doug Wheatley (Star Wars Empire, 
Superman, and The Incredible Hulk, among others) is attractive but obviously has to take 
some short cuts from the 137-minute film. The action scenes also are less dramatic than 
theClone Wars graphic novel series. But it's a coup that this adaptation includes a late 
Yoda scene that was not in the film but is already rumored to be an extra on the inevitable 
DVD. --David Horiuchi
Patricia C. Wrede is the universally acclaimed author of The Enchanted Forest Chronicles 
series, including Dealing with Dragons, Searching for Dragons, Calling on Dragons, and 
Talking to Dragons, as well as other novels, including Mairelon the Magician, The Magician's 
Ward, and, with Caroline Stevermer, Sorcery and Cecelia, The Grand Tour, and The Mislaid 
Magician. She lives in Minnesota.
Other Books
William Shakespeare's Tragedy of the Sith's Revenge, Experience the Star Wars saga 
reimagined as an Elizabethan drama penned by William Shakespeare himself, complete 
with authentic meter and verse, and theatrical monologues and dialogue by everyone 
from Bail Organa to Count Dooku. Something is rotten in the state of Coruscant! The 
schemes of Emperor Palpatine come to fruition as Padmé Amidala, Obi-Wan Kenobi, 
Yoda, and the other Jedi duel against the clone troopers of General Grievious and the 
nascent Empire. Authentic meter, stage directions, reimagined movie scenes and dialogue, 
and hidden Easter eggs throughout will entertain and impress fans of Star Wars and 
Shakespeare alike. Every scene and character from the film appears in the play, along with 
twenty woodcut-style illustrations that depict an Elizabethan version of the Star Wars 
galaxy.

Download Book Star Wars, Episode 3: Revenge Of the Sith BY Patricia C. Wrede

Page: 2 of 3 : https://wocoentala.org/source1/735b66c085e87775861bbf3507c37744



�����. Experience the Star Wars saga reimagined as an Elizabethan drama penned by 
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