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Book by Guha Ramachandra
Documents the dramatic conflicts that have shaped modern India while evaluating the 
factors that have helped maintain stability and democracy throughout the region, in a 
post-Partition history that offers insights into the lives and contributions of Jawaharlal 
Nehru, Indira Gandhi, and lesser-known citizens. 40,000 first printing.
Born against a background of privation and civil war, divided along lines of caste, class, 
language and religion, independent India emerged, somehow, as a united and democratic 
country. This remarkable book tells the full story-the pain and the struggle, the humiliations 
and the glories-of the world's largest and least likely democracy.

Ramachandra Guha writes compellingly of the myriad protests and conflicts that have 
peppered the history of free India. But he writes also of the factors and processes that 
have kept the country together (and kept it democratic), defying numerous prophets of 
doom who believed that its poverty and heterogeneity would force India to break up or 
come under autocratic rule. Once the Western world looked upon India with a mixture of 
pity and contempt; now it looks upon India with fear and admiration.

Moving between history and biography, this story of modern India is peopled with 
extraordinary characters. Guha gives fresh insights on the lives and public careers of those 
long-serving prime ministers Jawaharlal Nehru and Indira Gandhi. There are vivid sketches 
of the major "provincial" leaders whose province was as large as a European country: the 
Kashmiri rebel turned ruler Sheikh Abdullah; the Tamil film actor turned politician M. G. 
Rama-chandran; the Naga secessionist leader Angami Zapu Phizo; the socialist activist 
Jayaprakash Narayan. But the book also writes with feeling and sensitivity about lesser 
known (though not necessarily less important) Indians-peasants, tribals, women, workers 
and musicians.

Massively researched and elegantly written, India After Gandhi is at once a magisterial 
account of India's rebirth and the work of a major scholar at the height of his powers.

Other Books
Reshaping India in the New Global Context, This book traces the history of India's progress 
since its independence in 1947 and advances strategies for continuing economic growth. 
Insiders and outsiders that have criticized India for slow economic growth fail to recognize 
all it has achieved in the last seven decades, including handling the migration of over 8 
million people from Pakistan, integrating over 600 princely states into the union, managing 
a multi-language population into one nation and resolving the food problem. The end 
result is a democratic country with a strong institutional foundation. Following the growth 
strategies outlined in the book and with a strong leadership, India has the potential to 
stand out as the third largest economy in the world in the next 25 to 30 years.Subhash Jain 
and Ben Kedia delve into India's development and emergence as an economic power, one 
of the three countries that can make its own supercomputers, one of the six countries that 
can launch satellites and that has the second largest small car market in the world. They 
discuss its need for innovative initiatives and top leadership to pursue an agenda of 
economic growth, and monitored policies to encourage entrepreneurship at all levels. With 
an emphasis on the new leadership of Prime Minister Modi, the book identifies policies that 
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need to be adopted to make India's future bright and prosperous. This book is a critical 
resource for students and scholars interested in India and invested in its progress, as well as 
policymakers, government officials and corporations considering India as a place to 
expand and do business.
�����. This book traces the history of India's progress since its independence in 1947 and 
advances strategies for continuing economic growth."
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