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Discover how to use managerial economics to both diagnose and solve business problems 
with this breakthrough text, designed specifically for MBA students. Froeb/McCann/Ward/
Shor's MANAGERIAL ECONOMICS, 5E offers a succinct, fast-paced, yet challenging, 
approach full of invaluable insights. This edition incorporates less math and fewer technical 
models, graphs and figures than traditional managerial economics texts, while emphasizing 
the real decisions that today's managers face daily. You'll find this learning guide useful 
both now and throughout your business career. The latest economic updates keep you 
abreast of the most recent economic developments and current economic challenges 
worldwide. You learn how to apply economic theory to even the most formidable business 
challenges.
Dr. Froeb received his undergraduate degree from Stanford University and Ph.D. from the 
University of Wisconsin. When the antitrust agencies began using his models to predict the 
competitive effects of mergers, his academic research passed what he calls "a market 
test." This resulted in his 2003 appointment to Chief Economist of the Federal Trade 
Commission, where he enforced the antitrust and consumer protection laws of the United 
States. He also managed 75 economists who tore down barriers to competition (often 
erected by well-meaning bureaucrats). In July 2005 Dr. Froeb returned to Vanderbilt 
University where today he holds the William Oehmig Chair of Entrepreneurship and Free 
Enterprise. He used to win the "Most Outstanding Teacher" award, but now he finishes 
behind his co-author, Brian McCann. His text, MANAGERIAL ECONOMICS: A PROBLEM-
SOLVING APPROACH is well recognized for teaching students to apply economics to real 
business problems. It is filled with real world problems (and solutions) from Dr. Froeb's 
students and clients. Dr. Froeb's research focuses on the economics of competition policy. 
He has taught at Tulane University, worked at the U.S. Department of Justice, and spent a 
year at the University of Chicago Law School.

Dr. Brian T. McCann has taught courses in managerial economics, strategic management, 
and entrepreneurship at the undergraduate, MBA and executive education levels. He holds 
an MBA from Vanderbilt University, where he earned the Founder's Medal as the top 
graduate of his class. Dr. McCann received his doctoral training in strategic management at 
Purdue University's Krannert School of Management, where he was awarded the Ross 
Fellowship, the Krannert Certificate for Distinguished Teaching, and the Purdue Research 
Foundation Research Grant. His more than 10 years of industry experience include 
operating a residential land development company, serving as the CFO for an Internet 
start-up, and implementing new strategic initiatives for a non-profit economic development 
group. In addition to co-authoring this MBA-level textbook in managerial economics, Dr. 
McCann's work has appeared or is forthcoming in journals, such as Strategic Management 
Journal, Journal of Management, and Journal of Management Studies. His current research 
interests span strategic management and entrepreneurship and include the performance 
implications of firm agglomeration, the effects of ownership structure on competitive 
behaviors, and the role of threshold-based decision making in the entrepreneurial 
process.

Dr. Mike Ward has taught courses in Managerial Economics, Industrial Organization and 
Business Strategy, Human Resource Economics, and Economics and Regulation of 
Information. He has spent nearly two decades in academia, holding positions at the 
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University of Illinois and the University of Texas at Arlington where he is currently Professor 
of Economics in the Business School. Prior to returning to academia, Dr. Ward served as an 
Economist at the Federal Trade Commission for four years attempting to tear down 
barriers to competition (though he was not managed by Dr. Froeb). Dr. Ward's research 
focuses on the economics of innovation and competition. He earned his undergraduate 
degree in mathematics and economics from UCLA and his Ph.D. in economics from the 
University of Chicago.
Other Books
Intermediate Microeconomics and Its Application, Discover an exceptionally clear, concise 
introduction to microeconomics using an approach that avoids high-level mathematics but 
still offers meaningful practice with Nicholson/Snyder's INTERMEDIATE MICROECONOMICS 
AND ITS APPLICATION, 13E. These prestigious authors present the economics of markets 
using a managerial focus and a variety of approaches, including intuitive illustrations, 
graphical presentations and some simple algebra. A wealth of relevant applications and 
current examples demonstrate microeconomics at work in a variety of settings. In addition, 
updated step-by-step problems and engaging activities allow you to learn by doing. This 
edition's full-color revisions explain the latest developments and events, including the 
economic impact of the COVID pandemic. Trust the resources in this edition to further 
strengthen your understanding and mastery of microeconomics today. Important Notice: 
Media content referenced within the product description or the product text may not be 
available in the ebook version.
�����. In addition, updated step-by-step problems and engaging activities allow you to 
learn by doing. This edition's full-color revisions explain the latest developments and events, 
including the economic impact of the COVID pandemic."
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